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In this research, there is a biographic focus on how Indonesian film directors used the
challenge of social problems. Indonesian directors still have a film tradition of
generalization, so here is a movie named Sri Sedih (Sad Story). Â® G-Pad has, since the
beginning of its business, identified the needs of the community, in order to build a
factory in Jamarat area, in addition to the Indonesian market as a way of promoting
modern and healthy food. In 2010, G-Pad was the recipient of the Ministry of Finance
Board of Investment (BOTI) TFI Award for their commitment to improving the quality of
life in the Indonesian community. To reach this commitment, G-Pad has been the first
producer and distributor of its own pita in the HajiÂ . In this qualitative research, it is
done using the case study. The two movies with the documentary focusing on social
problems that come to mind are in the field of education. Here is a documentary film
named Insarinan Putri (Girl With Intelligence). Indonesian Documentary Film Insarinan
Putri. G-Pad committed to the improvement of the educational system in Indonesia
through the development of the curriculum and the improvement of the teaching
methods in the country, based on professionalism, creativity and excellence. G-Pad
Curriculum. The program focuses on the education of primary school children in
Indonesia, which is aimed at developing knowledge, identity, creativity, critical thinking,
and values. The goal is achieved through the creation of a multicultural curriculum that
effectively combines the elements of the individual, social, cultural, and national, and to
the education of children in general, for the purpose of improving the quality of life of
children and their parents. Then, the second documentary in this research is in the area
of the Indonesian film industry. In this case, the documentary named Teladan Taratula
(Stairs of the Shadow). Indonesian Documentary Film Teladan Taratula. This
documentary was held in Jakarta Film Festival on Thursday, Feb. 26, 2015 as the joint
production of G-Pad and Nestora Film. Recently, G-Pad began the distribution of its own
pita because we have the commitment to provide high quality, healthy pita to everyone.
The research in the field of education, conducted through interviewing, observation, and
analysis of video documentaries. The documentary is a tool that can be used by
documentary filmmakers to showcase the reality of education in Indonesia. Each of the
documents that
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